
 
 

 
 

 

 

The Blueprint  June Gems 

June 4, 2024· 85mins 

Thanks for watching! Good morning, everyone. Happy Tuesday to you. Thank 
you so much for being here. Let me introduce myself if you are new to the stream, if it 
has been a while since you have been here, if you are new to Twitch in general. My 
name is Kim Blue. I am an HR strategist and a career coach. Welcome to the Blueprint. 
This is a space where we come on Tuesday mornings at 8 a .m. Eastern Standard Time 
and again on Thursdays at 11 a .m. Eastern Standard Time to talk about all things 
personal and professional development. I am a coach, a strategist, and an HR leader, 
and I believe that everybody should be the boss of their own blueprint, which means 
having access to knowledge, skills, capabilities, and resources so that you can operate 
at your highest potential, add value to whatever work you own or are responsible for, 
and you can show up as your most authentic self because when you do that, you can be 
great in your gifts, you do not have to dim your light, you can show up as you, you can 
give your best, and then you can receive the best that the world has to offer. That's why 
we're here, right?  

We show up, we do the work, we hold each other accountable, we do so from a 
place of love and support, and we wanna make sure that all of the things that are taking 
place are, you know, for our best and for our betterment, and so that's why we're here. 
We come and we learn how to do that in a very thoughtful and supportive way. So with 
that, let's do a little housekeeping, then jump right into June. I am really excited to talk 
about this month's topic. For the month of June, we are doing June Gems. So it is a 
month full of gems. It's all of the resources, all of the templates, documents, sayings, 
books that I'm reading, people to go follow, the stuff that you really want to be focused 
on to help you be your best.  

And so there will be Kim Gems that are mixed in there. So this month is all about 
gems and just things you're gonna be able to use. And I wanna make sure that I 
emphasize some of these things are going to feel like they're super structured. But 
honestly, what I'm doing is guiding you through how to use them in everyday 
conversation because that's the best and most empowering part is when you can take 
something and really making it easy to digest. That's what I believe. that HR strategy, all 
of these things should be, right? We hear these big buzzwords and I'm here to tell you 
that they don't have to be so difficult. So I think that all of the things that we are focused 
on, I'm sorry guys, give me one second, there we go.  

I think that all the things that we're focused on this month really are going to be 
things that you can't immediately put into your back pocket. Those of you who are being 



 
 

 
 

 

coached by me, whether it's formally in the coaching group or whether it is informally 
through conversations that we're having or those of you who may be deciding that you 
want to be a part of the coaching group or you're thinking about having some coaching 
with me, this is a really good month for you to say, yes, I want to be involved in 
somewhere shape or form. So give it some thought, right? Because the gyms that we 
drop this month are going to be things that I think will help you no matter where you are 
personally, professionally, and there's things that you're gonna be able to hold on to 
outside of here. All right, so June Gems, that is the theme for the month.  

Get your pens ready, get your notebooks ready because there's gonna be lots of 
things here. There are going to be opportunities for you to get access to these 
documents to guide you and then manipulate them to make them your own. So anything 
like today, we're gonna do a RACI chart. And if you want it, I'm gonna have you reach 
out to me with the word RACI and then I'll be able to send this to you and it'll be easy for 
me to give it to you. And this will be in a form that is where you can either print it, right? 
It's not editable right now, but I'm working on a version that is editable, but it's got the 
definitions and it's got everything you'll need in here to guide you today, okay? So with 
that, let's say good morning to who is in this stream and then we will kick off the 
conversation. So good morning, Kalak first, who is on a plane, ladies and gentlemen, if 
you were not watching over the weekend, you definitely missed a treat Soul Train Live 
took place and Kalak was the person that kicked off all of the streaming on Sunday.  

He was up first followed by our Girl Champ Lifestyle DJ and a few others who 
were there and he kicked it off and he did an amazing job. And then he was the official 
photographer for Soul Train Live. And so just shout out to Kay who is in the chat from 
the plane this morning. So I will be modding right while he's flying. And obviously Malak 
Journey is not with us. She continues to recover. She sends her love. She may be 
behind, she may be lurking behind the scenes, but she's not actively modding while she 
gives her brain and her body a chance to recover. I have seen her and she is doing 
really well. Like seeing her virtually not in person yet. And she's doing much better. She 
had great reports from the doctors last week whenever she went. Very good to see Her 
and she sends all of her love and gratitude to everybody who has reached out Okay, so 
good to see you.  

Hey, good morning. Good morning. LaWanda basketball. Good to see you as 
well I saw LaWanda basketball over the weekend in New York. I'll do a little bit of an 
update there as well Good morning. Ebony ATL. Good to see you. Good morning 
Hobbs. I saw you sneak in here as well Good to see you T DJ TNT. Good to see you. 
Happy Tuesday. How are things in your world? It has been a while That doesn't mean 
you haven't been lurking. It just means that I haven't seen your actual name In my chat, 
so nice to see you in here for sure and I hope that you are doing amazing Virtual salute 
to anybody who is working lurking or commuting We all know what this time of day is So 



 
 

 
 

 

I want the chat to be in service to you and the community to be in service to you in 
whatever way Possible so whether you are active or listening.  

Thank you my lurker population is really big and I know you all absorb the 
information that is important to you when you take away what is needed and that's what I 
want this space to be so continue to let that serve you in whatever way is possible. All 
right so let's kick off with a little bit of a New York takeover recap. I was just in New York 
over the weekend spending time with One Reason and Chanel B and the B side and I 
officially launched the blueprint live. Some of you may have been in the chat last year. I 
was in One Reason stream and it was after he had come spend some time and he said 
you know we just need to like go on tour Kim Blue like I'm just going to manifest the 
blueprint live taking place. Sorry you guys my camera's a little cloudy so it should clear 
up momentarily and so he said that out loud and I was like laughing but he meant it and 
he would bring it up from time to time right on you know miraculous motivational 
Mondays or whatever the case may be and he would say it or after one of my streams 
on Tuesday if I was able to get into his stream again during the week like he would 
mention it again and say you know Kim needs to go on tour and so at the beginning of 
this year he said will you come speak at the NYC takeover and I said yes and he was 
like I want you to do the blueprint live.  

I want you to talk about leadership and he had very specific things and so I went 
and I did it and it was wonderful. There's like 25 people it was nice to see people that I 
had not met folks that I have now seen on multiple occasions and now because I've 
seen them so much I'm getting to know them and have great things to talk to them about 
or sometimes just be in their presence right more often than not I just want to listen to 
what other people are doing or ask questions about how they're doing and so the 
blueprint live officially kicked off and it was amazing to just be up there. I think a few 
people watched it on Twitch, if I'm not mistaken it was on either Reason's stream or 
maybe Chanel B's stream, but it was awesome to be in person with folks. I will be putting 
up a post and posting pictures.  

Very big shout out to my unofficial, official camera woman, LaWanda Baskerville, 
who sent me a slew of pictures yesterday when I asked her if she could send me some, 
so it was nice to just be among folks. And I got to meet so many amazing people. I got to 
meet Mike City and Shelby Nicole Cosplay for the first time. I got to meet Reason for the 
first time, which was great. I got to meet Shelly Thunder and this girl Christina, right? So 
many people DJ Epic, DJ Fuego NYC was there on Friday night. I see you, Hobbs. Man, 
just so many awesome people miss Chocolaté. I got to meet Jay Trey for the first time. 
So, so many. Great folks, and I really made time to talk to as many folks as I possibly 
could while I was there Especially if it were people that I hadn't meet I got to meet Kiki B.  

Who mods for DJ Molly party Drew being copping cutie were there So I got a lot 
of time with them a little bit of time on third on Friday night And then I spent some good 
time with them on breakfast at Saturday Just talking right and just fellowshipping and 



 
 

 
 

 

being in the presence of Others I got to meet DJ Eclipse So just a lot, you know 9k9 was 
there and I take 9k9 drove in from Toronto y 'all so it was it was nice and I left right after 
my my part of the of the Saturday presentation because I needed to get back for Some 
childcare to Avery, but other than that it was a really great event Happy that I did it and 
really happy that I got to meet people and launch The unofficial blueprint live tour. So 
next stop is OMU. I will have a part of their panel on that Friday So I will be at OMU only 
from Thursday to Saturday.  

It will be a shortened trip. So I won't be there Saturday night or Sunday, but I will 
be there And so the blue it'll be some version of the blueprint live there that I'm talking 
about Career wellness at OMU and weaving that in among all the other great folks who 
are going to be on the panel So I will see those of you who were not in New York or 
those of you who? You know, I may not get to see again I will be at OMU just for a quick 
day So I'll be there Thursday all day for the conference on Friday and Saturday So it was 
a great time Thank you reason or Shelley or if you're listening or lurking behind the 
scenes for everything and for inviting me. I look forward to Just continuing to stay 
connected in these spaces and really supporting these meetup communities Right 
because there's a lot of intent behind what that is being able to not only network but 
connect and contribute All right. So awesome, awesome. So thank you to everybody 
who helped make it happen for sure. Big Stove, good to see you. Thank you for being 
here and thank you for the re -up. No need to run to the bushes yet, Stove.  

We haven't kicked off today's conversation yet. So for those who are just coming 
in behind the sea or who have been lurking, for June, we are talking about June gyms. 
The entire month is just things that you need to know. Good things, informative things, 
stuff that is going to help you. And you're going to be able to use this on the personal 
side and the professional side. And I want to give it to you in a way that's easily 
digestible so that right you all know you can go right to your next conversation. Even if 
it's only one question that will help you or one statement that will help you. There is 
something to be said for how you take in what we talk about this month. And so each 
Tuesday and Thursday, there will be some level of gyms, whether it's books that I'm 
reading, people to go follow either on social media spaces or on LinkedIn, places that I'm 
going to be connected to that I think are going to be important for you to follow, all of 
that. So I think that that is what is most exciting to me is that I can start to farm some of 
these things out to you, because as we are doing the work of who we need to be on the 
inside, so we can show up at our best on the outside, this is where it starts.  

And we start here together. Okay. So June gyms, that is the theme for June. It's 
all about gyms and how you can apply this. Today, we're going to do two things. The 
gym that we're going to talk about is a RACI model. Now, RACI is one of those things, 
it's a tool that you may feel like super formal, but I'm going to make it very easily 
understandable for you. And then if you want the graphic afterwards, I'll just have you 
either DM me in, right? Oh, look at you, LaWanda basketball. I see what you did there, 



 
 

 
 

 

June gym and ice. So shout out to all the June gym and ice out there. Because these 
gyms are going to be there for you. So Hobbs, listen, you asked me how you can get 
access to past blueprints.  

They're all on the website and you should have access to that behind that firewall 
soon. So I think Jen can give you the access to that. Or if there's a particular one that 
you just want to, if you can want to catch up on them, I can get you the ones that you 
want for like the times that you've been on the move. So I got you. I just don't know that 
Jen has had a moment to respond to you. She's been traveling a little bit for some family 
things. So you let me know. Good morning. Letitia P. Good to see you. Happy Tuesday. 
Okay. Okay, Hobbs. So good morning, Auntie Diddy. Good to see you welcome in thank 
you so much for being here and for kicking off this hype train with the re -up for the last 
11 months man so many things are taking place and I'm telling you this whole weekend 
in New York right and auntie did he just made me remember this when when she re -
upped right for 11 months so I've spent a lot of time reflecting on my time on Twitch and 
people will say to me like what are you gonna do next what is like what's really next and I 
think I've said to you all that like the goal at some point is to branch out and you know 
find myself on TV even though that's not necessarily where I thought I'd ever be but 
people repeatedly are like the things that you have to say people should know and so I'm 
trying to figure out what that looks like and I spoke to a woman randomly over the 
weekend on Friday I had some travel delays but I believe that delays are by design And 
so this particular woman who is also a coach but in a different way was more coaching 
me around like how to manifest that, oh my goodness. Sorry you guys, there's Griffin 
who is making a fair amount of noise. He's sitting at my feet. So if you hear him, that's 
where it's coming from. And by the way, thank you all for the re -ups and for the hype 
train.  

I appreciate all of you. I am so sorry you guys, he is a big stove. I see you on 
speaking about the TV. So listen, apparently that's the thing that it needs to be next. Big 
stove says it and then runs off, right? But apparently that's the thing that's next on my list 
because this lady that I spoke to who told me she was gonna remain accountable with 
me made me describe the actual TV show. Hold on for one second, you guys. Give me 
just a moment. You There we go, sorry you guys okay, I just needed to get Griffin 
situated Um, he is going to, okay. So just for awareness, I did take him out this morning 
and he, he was, he was not having any, he was not having any parts of being outside. 
And now that I'm streaming, of course he wants to like make himself known and his 
presence known. So Avery's going to come and take him out, uh, long enough to get him 
situated. So apologize for all the background noise.  

I promise you that he is, um, a well -loved dog and he's very well cared for. And 
we were up and walking at six 30 AM this morning. So he's just being, he's just being 
Griffin. Good morning, Panderas. Good to see you. Hope things are well Panderas. The 
last time I saw you, you were going into an interview. How did it go? And like drop some 



 
 

 
 

 

notes in the chat, right? He wants all the fuss this morning for sure. So. Bear with me 
just one second, ladies and gentlemen. you Okay, so, yes, Kayla, right, he is absolutely 
making his presence known. I'm so sorry, you guys, I do not know why my camera is 
super blurry. Maybe this is my son, Big Stove, that TV really is it so that I don't have a 
blurry camera. And Stove, you're right, he is absolutely one of the biggest lap dogs you 
will ever see. Stove got to meet him last time, but he was just standing at the door, like 
whining and whining and whining and being all the things.  

So nonetheless, she was holding me accountable. And so she made me, and 
Ebony, I was thinking about you saying, right, am I ready for the things that I'm 
manifesting? This particular woman made me outline and describe what my TV show 
would look like. And then she made me say, and then she specifically made me say, tell 
me like where people can go find this TV show? Like, is it a network? Is it like, are we on 
Netflix? Like, how are people going to access it? And so I had to describe all these 
things that I hadn't ever really thought about. I just sort of knew they were looming like in 
my brain. And she started to force me to put some of these pieces together, right?  

Good morning, Keith. Good to see you. I see you coming in, sneaking in and 
making the... the couch available for sure. Thank you. And so I had to describe this 
whole journey that I was on around if I were to have a TV show what would it be called 
and what would I be doing and who would be like the type of guest and all of these 
things and then like what's the actual blueprint like what do I model it after and I gave her 
some examples and I was like think like this meets this and this and she's like and 
what's the vibe and what's the ambiance and all the things that are there and so she 
made me describe all of that and so I spoke out loud what this TV show opportunity is 
going to be like and I had not done that and it was on the spot in real time all of those 
things so it was very scary and very exciting all at the same time and I don't know what 
I'm going to um I don't know how I'm gonna do that but or if it's ever gonna happen But 
apparently it is because I've already said it out loud.  

So I say all that in between kicking out the blueprint live Going to OMU. I've now 
Conspired on this television show or media platform that apparently I'm going to have 
and I'm just gonna leave that there. Right? So that's what that I'm asking that because 
as we talk about these June gems some of the things that We will talk about Are going to 
be a part of this and so I want to introduce this book Pandaris I see your response that 
says it was a misunderstanding which kind of makes me a little sad for you It was a 
coincidence and so it needed to be local that's okay Oh my goodness, so your company 
just went through an acquisition and You're losing your leadership, which is fair and it 
happens Okay, well keep us posted right some of those there are so many folks in here 
Pandaris who have gone through all of those things Leadership shifts folks who work for 
some great companies who have seen that I've been through that Numerous times as a 
CHRO and it happens and sometimes there's a lot of good things that happen and 
sometimes There's a lot of wait and see that happens And so I'm sending you good 



 
 

 
 

 

energy as far as the next steps with your company our concern acquisitions can be a lot 
so If if I or anybody else in here can help you, please say something. Okay. All right So 
for our June gems, we're going to talk about the racy and I'm gonna introduce you to this 
book that About Literally, it's about unlocking your winning season.  

Okay, right exactly Kayla shift happens 100% as far as that's concerned. So this 
the name of this book is called bet on you Okay, and I will link to this somewhere 
because I'm going to feature her name. The lady that wrote it is Iona Presley Annas. So 
she is someone who I do some work with in the Black and HR. She used to work for, I 
think she still does, but she works for Netflix. And she is just, she's an amazing leader. 
HR leader, yeah, like big time, like works for Netflix and wrote a book and has kids and 
is like a whole mom boss and is doing her thing. And I love her. And so when she 
launched this book, Black and HR was actually going to do a feature on her and I was 
going to moderate the conversation and it didn't happen. And so I'm actually thinking 
about just doing this with her myself because her book is amazing. And so I want to 
read. And so in this, spirit of what we're doing and what we're talking about. I want to 
introduce a gym that Ayanna puts in here when she talks about betting on yourself.  

Good morning, Shelly Thunder. Good to see you. Thank you so much for being 
here. Happy Tuesday to you, Shelly. All the hugs to you. I got a chance to finally meet 
Shelly Thunder and I couldn't yell it out because it was really loud in the place that we 
were in on Friday night, but I didn't quite get lots of hugs while I saw her and she can 
attest to that. So good to meet you, Shelly. So in this book, the second chapter, I'm 
going back and rereading some things in the second chapter that I want to introduce you 
to before we get to the racing model. The chapter is called Just Decisions. And so 
Ayanna talks about this whole notion of like decision making, which you all have heard 
me talk about the importance of making good decisions. Why? But also the path on 
which we make decisions and how we think about that. And I want to read this to you. 
Okay. And this is not me. This is Ayanna, but I want to make sure that you know that this 
is a philosophy that I am subscribing to, which means that is a blueprint staple. And 
these are the foundational things that we're going to come back to. And so I'm going to 
read this to you. And she opens up the chapter talking about playing a video game that 
allows you to skip levels, but inputting cheat codes.  

So anybody in here, like a Super Mario Brothers fan, like, you know, in Mario 
Brothers, you could jump and then you would go down those tunnels and you could skip 
worlds like five, six and seven, get to level eight, defeat King Koopa, right? And defeat 
the game without having to go through like the water world and the, you know, the grass. 
I can't remember all the upside down ones, but like all of those things, right? So you 
could go in and you could do some of that. So that's the metaphor. that we're working 
with, right? It's this whole notion of sometimes our decisions are like those tunnels in the 
video games. And this is what she says, okay? And I want everybody to hear this 
because I think it's very important. Because when I read this, she stepped on my toes. 



 
 

 
 

 

And so now I'm gonna step on your toes via this passage. She says, I believe there is no 
such thing as a good or bad decision. There are only decisions.  

Some decisions you make can help you skip or bypass a few life levels. Other 
decisions take you on a more scenic route through life. I can go left, I can go right, and I 
will still end up at the same place. However, left could be a shortcut and it will get me to 
my destination quicker, okay? I wanna talk to you all for just a moment about those of 
you who are choosing to take the scenic route. because you know that if you jump down 
the tunnel you'll get to where you want to be faster. Sometimes we accept the scenic 
route because the scenic route has distractions. The scenic route allows us to avoid the 
work. The scenic route does not hold us accountable for the steps that we need to take 
once we go down the tunnel because when we go down the tunnel and we know it's 
going to shorten our path to greatness it will though increase the amount of work that we 
need to to do in a short amount of time and that's where we begin to question am i 
capable am i ready do i have what it takes and the imposter syndrome and the negative 
mantras and all the things that we talk about in the blueprint start to show up okay thank 
you all for the hype train by the way i was so wrapped up in uh in the chat and talking to 
other things that i wanted to make sure so uh meesh good to see you thank you so 
much for being here happy tuesday to you excellent to hug you on saturday meesh 
meese so nice to see your smile in real time thank you so much for being here um 
always good to see you and welcome into the blueprint happy eight months with us okay 
well lwanda i see you thank you so much for being here i will i will um do this and lwanda 
her name is um ayana pressley anis and so let me spell her name it's a -y -a -n -n -a and 
then anis is a -n -i -s okay and the name of the book is bet on you and so i am going to 
drop the link um because i want to talk about her i'm going to do a post i gotta go find her 
stuff on social so that i can make sure i get in here um but she says a simple easy to 
read perspective on unlocking your winning season may this book find the exact 
audience that it was meant for and i guarantee you that this is an audience that it was 
meant for okay so i'm going to read this again as as our folks are coming in here, but 
we're gonna let the raid come in and settle. And then we're gonna talk about decision -
makings and then we're gonna do our race before we get out of here. So good morning, 
one reason, and everybody from the Gospel Takeover family, so good to see all of you.  

Happy Tuesday to you. Thank you so much for being here. If you're not following 
one reason and all the amazing folks who are in here, please do so. But in this particular 
moment, especially one reason, because he's bringing everybody over. Reason, thank 
you so much. So, so excellent to meet you on Friday. Reason, and happy Tuesday to 
you. I hope your stream was excellent. Come on in, Gospel Takeover fam and get 
comfortable next to your blueprint boss, Bestie. Okay. Keith, I will hold off until after you 
drop off, young Asher, I got you, Keith. Don't worry, the raid is coming in, so I'll wait so 
you can catch this, okay? And good morning, young Asher, if you can hear. So come on 
in, gospel takeover family, good to see you. Listen, find a seat on the couch, borrow a 



 
 

 
 

 

blanket from Dr. Dady, share a pew with Hobbs. I think she's still in here, but everybody 
get comfortable because we are talking about June Jims.  

That is the theme for June. For those who may be coming in for the first time, my 
name is Kim Blue. I am an HR leader, I am a strategist, and I am a coach. This is the 
blueprint in the space we come on Tuesday and Thursday mornings to talk about all 
things personal and professional to the professional development. I make HR easily 
digestible for you so that you can apply it to your life. And for the month of June, we are 
talking about June Jims. Everything that you want to know, should know, and can take 
away and apply to your next immediate conversation, okay? I believe that when we are 
learning about these concepts and these frameworks, yes, there's a ton of big 
buzzwords, but it does not have to be hard. These are things that you should be able to 
hear and then go, I think I understand how I can use that, and then go use it in your next 
conversation, in the next time that you are with social communities, anything where 
you're gonna be able to apply the things that you learned, okay? So that's what we are 
talking about in June. So every conversation is gonna be June Jims. So I may be 
introducing you to an author, a book, a framework, a model, and we're gonna talk in here 
about how I use it, and then I'm gonna help you understand how you can use it in your 
day to day.  

So for those who are lurking, lurk on, but make sure you have your pens and 
your notebooks. For those who are active in the chat, whether it's with each other, 
please drop your questions. Please use the highlight method or the highlight function. I 
wanna make sure that I don't miss any questions over the month of June, because we 
are gonna be talking about lots and lots of really. great gems. There will be some new 
Kim gems that get introduced during this month, and there will be the opportunity to 
connect with all of the things and where you can go find some of these resources. In 
particular, starting with this book, it's called Bet on You, and it is by a young lady named 
Ayanna Pressley Anis, and it is the book that we are going to be focused on. And so 
we're going to be talking about making decisions, and the reason that I'm focusing on 
this, because the racing model that we're going to talk through is all about how to 
leverage the power of decision making and who needs to be involved.  

So it looks like the raid has settled, so I will come in. Good morning to everybody 
who came in on the raid. Whether you gave a new follow, thank you for all the new 
follows. Thank you for everybody who is continuing to lurk in the stream behind the 
scenes. Reason I gave a recap at the top of my stream today and just said it was 
wonderful And I talked about how you manifested the blueprint going on tour. And so the 
blueprint live was official In the space on Saturday for the NYC takeover. So thank you 
for having me It was amazing to see everyone and be in in the building with all of you So 
to everybody who came in on the raid. Good morning. Good morning to you and it's me 
the em is chocolate I say good to see you.  



 
 

 
 

 

Mr. Nate good to see you and meet you on Saturday DJ Fuego NYC Good to 
meet you over the weekend as well. Thank you all for being here Odell Aries. Good 
morning to you Thank you for being here. Shelly always good to see you. Thank you for 
coming in again on the raid Okay, thank you for putting the name of the book in the chat. 
I saw that as I was describing What were your focus and on Jazzy Mimi? Good to see 
you. Welcome in Happy Tuesday everybody else who came in on the raid cop and cutie 
always good to see you So good to hug you and see your face over the weekend. Kevin 
Browns. Welcome in good to see my bro Always good to have you and your energy in 
the chat. If I missed anybody, please say good morning So that I can shout you out and 
make sure I show you some love Welcome in everybody to the to the blueprint hob says 
the pew has room and the couch is open So there is going to be space for everybody to 
get their life Um, so dope to meet you in person as well reason Um, it will not be the last 
time I'm just biding my time until i'm back and can get a chance to spend some more 
time with you for sure So I think I got everybody but if I didn't say hello in the chat Keith 
is back So now we can kick this thing off, right?  

Sage with a C. Good morning. Welcome in good to see you and then is it Ex 
nunya, did I say that correctly? Please let me know. Thank you for the following. 
Welcome in. Happy Tuesday Welcome to the blueprint to everybody who came in and 
followed and everybody who came in and Um said good morning for sure sure. All right. 
So June Jim's, that's what we're talking about. Okay. Okay, perfect. Thank you. So we're 
talking about June Jim's in the blueprint. If you have a section of your notebook that you 
are dedicating to notes, label this one June Jim's because everything is going to be 
something that you can use. And right now this is the book that I'm getting ready to read 
a passage to you on. It's called Bed on You. Hopefully everybody can see that. I will 
make sure that I dropped the information for this. This young lady, Ayanna Anis is a 
fellow HR executive.  

She works for Netflix. She's got a family. And in her spare time, she wrote a 
book, and it's all about betting on yourself and really easy, digestible things. And this, oh, 
there you go. It's a great reason you will love this book. Ebony, you will love this book, 
right? Hobbs, you will love this, all of you all, but those of you who I have gotten to know 
slightly more intimately, this is an amazing, amazing book, okay? And I wanna make 
sure that everybody who wants the opportunity to get it, this is going to be a gem in your 
life. She may have an Audible Version, Eb, let me ask. And if she does, and I will make 
sure, and so let me also check, because now that I've shared this on here, she may 
have an updated link or places where she could get this. So I think that she does have a 
version, if I'm not mistaken, when she launched it. So, oh, makes none, he says yes on 
Amazon for free, okay? So there you go, Eb, all right, thank you, okay, okay. So listen, 
folks, y 'all know if I bring someone or something to this chat, it's something that I have 
personally tried and true tested.  



 
 

 
 

 

I'm not gonna bring anything in here that is not legit or that I don't think is Kim 
Blue quality, and you all know how I roll. I don't put anything out there that I would not 
apply to my own life, okay? So we're gonna get to the racy model in just a minute, but I 
wanna talk about this. So in the book, in chapter two, she folks, the title of the book is 
Just Decisions, okay? And I'm gonna read this section to you. And what she does is she 
opens up with this analogy, and she talks about video games. And she said, you know 
how in certain video games, you are able to skip levels through putting in a cheat code 
or finding some type of secret key. And she gives the example of Super Mario Brothers, 
where you know how you can go to Super Mario Brothers and you can drop down in the 
tunnel, and the tunnel will allow you to skip to level eight, and then you can defeat King 
Koopa and defeat the game without having to go to the water world or go to the- the fire 
world or all of those worlds that you would need to beat if you wanted to just ultimately 
get to King Koopa, battle him and beat the game, okay? And so she's talking about 
making the decisions. Thank you, Kay, for putting all of this in here. And so I wanna read 
this passage to you because it's really relative about that.  

And then we're gonna talk about why the racing model is so important to making 
decisions. So the two gems that you're getting today are the book, which information 
Kayla has put in the chat. And then we're gonna talk about the racing model, which is a 
framework that I'm gonna give you. And you're gonna be able to use that. Good 
morning, Ms. Riz. I got to meet Ms. Riz over the weekend too. And to hug her, let me, 
can I just tell y 'all that Ms. Riz's energy translates on, off screen as it does on screen. It 
was the first thing that I noticed about her. I was like, oh, Ms. Riz is as advertised, 
period. Whether she is talking to you in the microphone. or whether she is chopping it up 
with you right here. And we had a lovely conversation and I got to give her a hug. So Ms. 
Riz, good to meet you. The Elevate Her, good to see you as always. Shout out to 
Nakesha Hicks who tried to slide in the back and she thought that she was gonna come 
in unannounced but little did she know that her friend Kim Blue was not gonna let that 
happen. Good to see you, Nakesha Hicks. Thank you for being here. We are chopping it 
up about all the things. June, Nakesha Hicks is all related to June gyms and all the 
things that I think are gonna be beneficial to you whether you are in the professional 
space or the personal space.  

So each conversation is dedicated to gyms that you can take away from you. 
And so I just introduced the book and now I'm gonna talk about the racing model. So 
good to see you, Keesha Hicks. I hope you are well. And today, because we played 
FaceTime Foam Tag yesterday, is gonna be some FaceTime time with your friend, 
okay? And Ms. Riz, thank you so much for, thank you so much for making your way into 
the stream. Good to see you today. So yes, reason, Ms. Riz is the truth. She was like 
one of the first people. She was like, I was standing in line to give you a hug. That was 
what she said to me when I came in Friday night to see her. She was like, I was waiting. 
I was just gonna stand here and I was waiting to like give you a hug and that was it. And 



 
 

 
 

 

then she said, may I buy you a drink? And that was how we started our conversation 
when I got a chance to meet her.  

So she is a beautiful soul. Jazzy Mimi was like full on the truth. So there's my Ms. 
Riz moment. All right, so I wanna read this passage to you and then we're gonna talk 
about the Racy. So she talks, she's talking about decisions and the Racy is a model 
around how to make decisions and who needs to be a part of those decisions and what 
that looks like. And so I gave the metaphor about the video games and this is what 
Ayanna has to say about decisions. And then I'm gonna go back. And what I said to you 
all right before the raid was Ayanna stepped on my toes when I... Read this and so now 
I'm going to step on Okay, baby, and so then and then I am going to step on your toes 
when I talk about this Okay, so here's what it says Everybody ready you got your pins 
and your notebooks because I don't want you to Miss it. You want to say good morning 
before I get started? Okay, there he is ladies and gentlemen. Oh Okay There he is. He 
just came back from doing mama's doing mama's a solid and taking the dog out and 
there's this one Right there.  

They both are there Yeah, there you go. Okay Mr. Scurlock Everybody's in there, 
right? You know who that is Everybody Let me tell you, Miss Chocolatay. Miss 
Chocolatay, who's that? Sage with a C, and there's Big Stove, and there's Shelly 
Thunder. Yup, and there's, there is. Oh, Scurries off again. Yes, everybody, everybody's 
in there saying good morning. See you guys later. And just like that, he's off, okay? 
Listen, Big Stove, Scurries off again, okay? Everybody is here. He is off, he has fulfilled 
his responsibility with the dog, okay, and now he's like, I'm out of here. And that's that on 
that, period, right? And you may not see him again for a few weeks, okay? That's it, 
right? And right, Sage with a C, just like that, runs off, okay? He'll be back to feed himself 
momentarily, but right now he is upstairs playing Minecraft. And I know, I hear him 
upstairs, right?  

He is playing Minecraft with his, with his, one of his besties, who's in another 
state right now. Okay, so everybody get your pens and pencils ready because I'm gonna 
read it. It stepped on my toes, and then I'm gonna step on your toes in the blueprint. 
Right, Ed, he scurried off for real. He was like, see you guys later, and he's out. Here it 
goes. According to Ayanna Anis, she says, I believe there is no such thing as a good or 
bad decision. There are only decisions. Some decisions you make can help you skip or 
bypass a few life levels. Other decisions take you on a more scenic route through life. I 
can go left or right, and I will still end up at the same place. However, left could be a 
shortcut, and it will get me to my destination quicker, okay? And then she goes on to 
say, once I discovered this idea and decided to live my life this way, it took away so 
much stress and anxiety from the daily decision -making process.  

Now, here's what I wanna say to you all, right? How many of you are choosing to 
take the scenic route through life, right? You have access to the tunnel. You have 
access to the route, the resources that could help you get where you want to be faster. 



 
 

 
 

 

But instead, you're taking the scenic route and it creates avoidance. It gives you access 
to distractions. It causes you to hesitate. It allows you to invite in other things that are 
going to block you from getting where you need to be as quickly as you could be there. 
Because here's the thing, more often than not, the place that you want to be, you know 
how to get there and you know what it means to be able to experience that. And what I 
mean by what it means is you've daydreamed about it. You've got this feeling in your 
heart and in your energy and in your mind. You've actually spent the time envisioning 
yourself in the very place. And yet you take the scenic route because the scenic route 
means that you don't have to take a miss. 

You don't want to make a mistake you don't want to have a mishap a 
miscommunication you don't want to show up any way other than ready willing and able 
and the moment that you step into the shortcut or you take the fast route or someone 
fast tracks you or you have the opportunity to show up in a particular way and it is less 
than the way you believe that you should present you don't want to be viewed as 
incapable inferior less than not having your things together and so instead of taking the 
tunnel and making it right we go through the water world and we suffer when we know 
we can't swim we go through the fireball level when we don't have on our kevlar and we 
don't have on our fireproof vest we go through all of these levels where we're in the 
desert and it's hot and we're not prepared for all of these things we literally find 
ourselves in the wilderness of life right the 11 -day journey that took how long y 'all okay 
because if anybody knows the story y 'all know it was only supposed to take them 11 
days and how long did it take them somebody put it in the chat go ahead and tell me 
right the 11 -day journey took them out where are you uh the elevator this right because 
we talk about this all the time right so they were out there 11 days but instead right come 
on y 'all 40 years okay y 'all know it 40 years okay miss riz right exactly keith y 'all know 
how long they were out there so some of y 'all who were supposed to be on an 11 -day 
journey or in the wilderness for 40 years because you want to be and then you want to 
complain that you ran out of water that you don't have any resources that nobody's 
coming to get you but it's all about choosing to make the decision for the shortcut 
because when you take the shortcut now you get afraid like oh i'm going to get there 
faster of course you're going to get there faster you're supposed to right it's meant for 
you to get there faster so that you can be in that space longer because the space that 
you're getting to faster is going to nurture you while you do the work but you're not 
thinking about it that way.  

You're just like, man, I'm gonna get there fast. Well, I don't have the right shoes. 
And if I'm gonna show up and who's gonna be there and how will I get back and what if 
something goes wrong? And all of the things to talk yourself out about taking the 
shortcut. So instead, we chalk it up to a bad decision instead of a decision that could 
move us forward towards our dreams, our goals, our aspirations, our ambitions, right? 
We're also afraid that if we make a decision to move forward, we gotta leave folks 
behind. We gotta leave things behind. We have to choose not to do some things that 



 
 

 
 

 

have been in our comfort zone. Things that have kept us on this hamster wheel. Things, 
narratives, people that we've been attached to that we now have to say, you know what?  

I can't take you with me because there's only space in this tunnel for one of us. 
You gotta find your own tunnel because I'm coming out of this desert into whatever my 
promised land is, okay? Vader says he has the vest and fire pants so he can support us 
if we are in that space. Good morning, Vader. Good to see you as always. Okay. So all 
of those things, I'm just saying to you, ladies and gentlemen, I'm going to go back to the 
chat because I see everybody putting their responses in. But the point is this, right? You 
know where you want to be, and you take the scenic route, right? And along the way, 
what happens? You run out of gas, you got to stop and get gas. You need lunch, right? 
You want to get out and snap some pictures. Sometimes the scenic route is not meant 
for that. Sometimes the scenic route is meant to get you to your next milestone. And 
then when you get to that milestone and it gives you a set of instructions so that you can 
bypass, it's like taking the exit to avoid the construction on the highway.  

Okay. If you are choosing to take the scenic route in life, I am going to encourage 
you to think about what tunnels do I have access to? What shortcuts do I have access to 
that are going to help? Okay. All of those things are available to us. And it all comes 
down to making decisions. It is very possible to bypass certain life levels. Let me be 
clear about that. But it all comes down to the decisions. And if we want to stay attached 
to certain narratives, or if we want to surrender the narrative, because you can't get a 
new story if you're attached to your old one. Okay. Mr. Nate, thank you so much for 
subscribing. I see you. Welcome into the blueprint as well. I see folks. Keith, I'm sorry. 
So Keith says, wait a minute. What if you're not intentionally taking the scenic route? 
Sometimes we aren't, Keith. Sometimes the unintentional scenic route is the path of 
avoidance. And what do we know about avoidance, ladies and gentlemen, somebody 
put it in the chat. Okay. What do we know about avoidance? Because sometimes we are 
not, we don't want to take the scenic route, but we take it.  

Sometimes the scenic route finds absolutely, we will own, right? 100%, you guys 
know this. Avoidance is not a strategy. We all know that. Indominable spirit, love you 
mean it, okay? Everybody knows, right? These 11 -day journeys that we're supposed to 
be on that are taking us 40 years. 40 years is a long time, y 'all, okay? It is not a short 
amount of time. Do you know what you can do in 40 years? Live a whole lot, right? And 
it takes all of that time to be able to move through some of the steps that we need to 
take. Good morning, Ms. KB, good morning, Rebel. Welcome in, good to see you. Great 
stream, yesterday, Rebel. Great, great stream. Good to see you, and thank you so much 
for being here. And here's the, and the Keisha Hicks says, and during that 40 years, 
there are folks that didn't even make it out during that time, right?  

And so there's all of these journeys that are happening and they're all a result of 
the decisions that we make and all of a result of the things that we said we want to do. 
Not only that, it's the things that once we get into this wilderness of our life, then we start 



 
 

 
 

 

to doubt and then we start to second guess. And then we start to undo this thing that 
we've been connected to, right? And we try to moonwalk out of that thing. That's what 
Vader told me I was doing yesterday. He asked me something and I said something and 
then I retreated. He was like, no, no, no, you can't moonwalk out of there, right? So we 
can moonwalk out of these things. And we try to get into our brains about all of the 
things that we know we need to do. And then yet we try to two -step or moonwalk or 
slide out. And those are the things that keep us from being connected to those shortcuts 
in life, right? Absolutely Ebony. And the moonwalk is so awkward. It's not even smooth 
like Mike did. It's real janky and right.  

You can't even get, you don't even have that smooth moonwalk rhythm. It's like 
your hips can't get it together, right? And then everybody sees you not moonwalking in 
your attempt to moonwalk. And they're like, what are you doing? I thought XYZ, right? 
Listen, Sage, the whole moonwalk. Moonwalk right on out of here. And it's impossible to 
be able to do. If you want to go or be somewhere, if you want to operate at a certain 
level, if you want to show up in the right way, you have to be open to accepting that 
perhaps there's no bad decision. There's just decisions. And that sometimes the scenic 
route is not necessarily the best route. It is a route, but is it the best route? And when 
you're along that scenic route, what are you doing? Are you questioning yourself? Are 
you aware that on this route, it is actually slower than if you were to take a tunnel, if you 
were to take a shortcut? Ms. KB says, currently try not to be at that step right now. And 
the hardest thing is to not overthink.  

Just focus on your why and do it absolutely. And so Ms. KB, if you were in 
conversations in May where we talked about overthinking being a barrier to momentum, 
right? Because when you overthink, it can slow you down. The overthinking is the thing 
sometimes, and I'm just using this as an example, right? But the overthinking is the thing 
that keeps us from saying, I know if I take this shortcut, it will be there, right? The woman 
that I spoke to on Friday during my airport delay as I was on my way to New York said to 
me, Kim, there's no reason you cannot have the entire outline for this show done in 90 
days. By the time your son goes back to school, because you already have the concept 
you already know what it is that you want to do. You already have the vision for what it 
is. There's no reason why you cannot absolutely manifest this entire show, including the 
opportunity to get the treatment in front of Netflix or wherever people are going to come 
find you in front of this.  

Like she was like, you can absolutely do this in 90 days. What's stopping you, 
right? Vader. Yes. So all of those things that she talked about are very much, and I had 
to sit there and literally say she's not wrong, right? And I'll spare you the details about all 
of the stuff that, you know, I talked to her about the show, right? But I told her what it 
was. And the thing is, and she was like, so what's stopping you right now? Because 
everything that you're saying to me, you got the vision, you got the name, you got the 



 
 

 
 

 

brand, you've got access, right? Like what's stopping you. And I had to acknowledge that 
probably there were some tunnels that I wanted to get through.  

Absolutely. Oh, site giver. It was a full bully session. It was a full bully session, 
right? A positive bully session, but very much a bully session. And she was very much 
like, so you already know this. And what got us started is, she's asked me the name of 
my podcast. And I said, it's the blueprint. And I said, well, one day when I interviewed 
Jay -Z, because, and we were talking about like, just him. And I said, you know, he is 
like, I, you know, a massive fan. And she said, well, what's keeping you from 
interviewing him? And I said, well, that's going to be when I, you know, I have my TV 
show one day. And that's what led into all of this. Right. So now, I want to talk about the 
racing model. Okay. Because as we think about these decisions that are available to us, 
I want us to really get clear on The parts of this, right, I want to get clear on the parts of 
this that can help you think through how to get yourself together, full stop.  

Full stop Melissa, right? It was a full on Kim Blue. Every once in a while Kim Blue 
does get Kim Blue and I need it and it makes me remember that, you know, I too have to 
stay accountable to the things because 95% of the time I do all of the things that I tell 
you all to do. There's that 5% of me though that's human and I'm like, I don't know, it's a 
TV show and I don't like my voice and blah, blah, blah. You know, all the stuff that you 
say, but at the same time there are things that need to go in place. So I want to show 
you this, this is the racing model. Can everybody see this? I'm gonna make it big 
enough, all right? So. If you're interested in this, please let me know and I will send it to 
you. But this RACI model, if you've not seen it, it's a really awesome and easy 
framework. Right. And this is always a great way to be able to think about how to get 
stuff done. And it's four easy steps. Every single person in this stream can adopt this. 
And if you are a leader of people, if you are a person who is responsible for projects or 
process, I promise you, this is something that you're going to be able to use. If you're 
just somebody who likes to make lists and then you want to make sure that you are 
getting yourself done, this is all going to be important. My Shorts of Brown, welcome and 
good to see you. Thank you for being here and joining the blueprint.  

We are talking this month, My Shorts of Brown, June is all dedicated to June 
gems. And so it's all of the Kim gems and things that I think are going to be beneficial for 
you to be able to use. Let me take this out for just a second. And so every stream will be 
dedicated to gems. So I introduced a book earlier, and then this framework, which is 
called the RACI matrix, is what I am offering to everybody. And it's really a way to make 
decisions. So let's go through this. Okay. So the first step in the RACI, the R stands for 
responsible. Okay. Responsible meaning who are responsible, it says stakeholders, 
right, who do the work and complete the objective. So who's responsible? This could be 
you, it could be your team, it could be people who assist you for those who work inside, 
you know, corporate America, think about this, right? If you have other key partners, 
finance or compensation, HR, right, think about who's responsible, who is the person 



 
 

 
 

 

that's the owner of the work, meaning that you are going to be the one to actually do the 
work see everything through. This first step, knowing who is responsible is so critical to 
the success of what is happening because if you don't know who is responsible, there's 
gonna be confusion immediately, right?  

And this is where the toe stepping starts because when we move from 
responsible, we then go into who is accountable, okay? And what I mean by that is if you 
don't know who is responsible, when the work does not get done, this is who all the 
fingers get pointed to. Well, Kim said that LaWanda Baskerville was the person that was 
gonna be responsible for sending out all the emails, but I haven't gotten an email. So 
Kim, what's up with these emails? I don't have this information. Did you tell LaWanda? 
Did LaWanda not do it? Did she, you know, what happened to her? Did something 
change and you not communicate it out? So this is the person who is actually the owner 
of the project. It's the person you're going to come back to when things go well, when 
things go wrong, right? Think about this person as being the quarterback. They are 
going to be the folks who are responsible. So when things are going well, I mean 
accountable for the action. So when things are going well, this is great. When things are 
going, when things are not going well, they're also going to this person, right? Good 
morning, Psalm. It's good to see you and to hug you over the weekend.  

Happy Tuesday morning. I hope you're doing well and thank you for being here. 
Okay. Now let's go on to the next step because now once we go away from 
accountability, right? So let's say LaWanda is the responsible person for sending the all 
issues responsible for all the comms. Okay. LaWanda is going to be the one that sends 
all of this out, but I am accountable for making sure that LaWanda sends it out. So I 
have a meeting with LaWanda and her and I sit down on my one that everybody needs 
to. Good morning, Tantrum. Good to see you. Happy Tuesday. Tantrum. We are talking 
about June Jim's and I'm going over this racey matrix and we are talking about an easy 
way to stay accountable, but also to make decisions. Tantrum. Okay. Hope you had a 
good weekend. So now, racey's quarter, Tantrum, right? So now if I've said to LaWanda, 
LaWanda, you are the person who is accountable for sending these things out, right? 
Vader says that he is responsible for the snacks. See Vader for the snacks, in particular, 
the peanut butter crackers. If you don't have any peanut, any, any allergies, he's the guy 
that's going to be able to get those for you.  

Okay. So now the next part of this is consulted, right? The people who should be 
consulted, who need to sign off on the project. So if the communications that LaWanda 
needs to send out. need to have support from Kaylok, Vader, and Ebony ATL. LaWanda 
is responsible for going and saying, hey, you guys, these communications are going to 
go out. I just want to make sure that you are aware. And I want to give you the 
opportunity to contribute. I want to give you the opportunity to understand what the 
content of it is. She's consulting them for their input. She's maybe even consulting them 
for what they can add to this so that they have awareness. Essentially, you consult folks 



 
 

 
 

 

so that they are not blindsided when whatever actions you have or whatever things that 
you schedule to take place are going to take place. It also allows you to identify any 
changes that may need to be made if there is a shift in responsibility or if the 
accountability goes from one person to another, from one thing to another. If there's 
changes in the timeline, you're now consulting people who potentially could be impacted 
by whatever is going on. Good morning, Amy Key, good to see you.  

Thank you so much for the re -up and for being here for 18 months. That is wild 
to me that you have been with me that long and I love every single moment of it, okay? 
Welcome in and good to see you. Finally, on the racy, you are looking at folks who need 
to be informed, okay? Informed mean we are not necessarily folks who need to be 
consulted, but you are being told, hey, listen, these communications are coming out. 
There's actually no action that is required from you. You don't need to be, you don't need 
to do anything, right? Think of the people who need to be informed. These are the folks 
in email who are either on the two line or the CC line, right? You're being copied for 
awareness only you're not required to contribute. You don't have any formal action. 
You're not responsible for anything. The purpose of this mail is to inform you about what 
is going on and the person who is responsible for sending the mail, which is the Wanda 
Baskerville is making sure that it goes out and I am owning the accountability, right? 
LaWanda consulted the folks and she's now informing everybody who is gonna be 
impacted by this change. MC2J man, welcome in, good to see you. Happy Tuesday, 
good morning, good morning. I hope you're doing well.  

Thank you so much for being here. So, Vader, don't get in trouble, Vader. So 
what I'm saying to everybody is, is when we think about this notion of a racy, what this 
does when we talk about making decisions is this gives you the ability to be solid in your 
decisions and know that your decisions are decisions that will get you, okay, all in a 
space where you are being clear on saying, no matter whether I go right or left, I know 
who's responsible, I know what I'm accountable for, I know who needs to be consulted, 
and I know who needs to be informed, okay? And I'm still gonna end up in the place that 
I need to be. What this does is it allows you to have a step -by -step approach, so that 
no matter what, you can always go back and say, okay, well, who was responsible for 
these things? And it gives you a thoughtful way to go and engage people to say, hey, 
listen, when we discussed this, when we decided that this was going to be our path 
forward, you were named the responsible person. Help me understand what changed, 
help me understand how I was able to, or how we got here, because now it sounds like 
we need to go consult and inform some folks, okay? All of those things are the way that 
we can make decisions. And... Good decisions or bad decisions, however you want to 
frame them up, but remember that they are decisions and these decisions are going to 
be the things that help you get where you want to be in particular with minimal distraction 
and as quickly as possible so that you can keep your 11 day journey, 11 days and that 
you don't find yourself off in the wilderness over the course of 40 years trying to 



 
 

 
 

 

understand what happened or what direction right things changed and where we went 
wrong right keep the music where did we go wrong.  

Any questions about the model itself right the racy framework any questions 
about the book right I wanted to make sure that I talked about this because as we talk 
about this whole notion of decisions right the last thing that I want to read to you and if 
there's questions please put them in the chat and realize somewhere. You might be 
doing this right but I honest says this she says I want to encourage you to stop making 
scenic route decisions okay because when you make scenic route decisions, thank you 
buddy okay when you make scenic route decisions, it can absolutely slow you down. 
Instead of advancing your agenda okay and we are all about the advancement of your 
agenda that's exactly what should be taking place okay. If you are wondering is it a 
decision that is going to advance you what she writes in the book is she says, if it makes 
your stomach eight and it keeps you up at night right those are the things that you 
should be. Those are the things that you should be thinking about those are the nudges 
that you know you feel it in your gut. Right it's the thing that you can't stop thinking about 
right Keith and I have Keith is still in here but Keith and I have these conversations all 
the time just sent me the bat signal yesterday. So I am sure that whatever we talk about 
today is gonna be one of those decisions that he's been mulling around in his brain, 
right? Or in his gut, and he's gonna be like, Kim Blue, I wanna talk about these things or 
how do I get here, right?  

And more often than not, it is being able to say those things out loud and 
recognize that you were, right? More often than not, I am redirecting Keith out of the 40 
year journey and being like, my guy, you got everything it takes. It's only, you only need 
to be on this 11 days, okay? It's an 11 day journey. And so I just, I calmly got him back, 
right? So that he does not do that, but that's the analogy that I wanna share with you all, 
right? It does not have to be this grandiose moment of overthinking of imposter 
syndrome, of looking into the mirror, Keith, right? Of looking in the mirror and 
questioning our ability to show up, okay? I'm telling you, these June gyms that we are 
talking about are going to are going to get us right and very much in alignment okay and 
she says this in here and i'm going to read this to you she says i'm here to encourage 
you to trust your gut make the decision and know that your decision will be right for you 
because guess what ladies and gentlemen you are in the exact place you're supposed to 
be you are exactly where you're supposed to be and guess what you're not going 
anywhere until you're supposed to go somewhere and maybe you're not going anywhere 
okay all of that is intentional i want everybody to write down or everybody to say to 
themselves or everybody to make a note in their phone or whatever it is but i want you to 
write i am exactly where i'm supposed to be so relax in the words of nakisha hicks this is 
what her and i say to each other get somewhere and sat down okay you are exactly 
where you are supposed to be even if you don't like it even if it feels uncomfortable even 
if you're like i don't want to be here you're supposed to be here please relax please 
pump the brakes please know that you're still here because whatever it is that you need 



 
 

 
 

 

to get from that space is exactly why you are still there and you will remain there until 
you get what you need to get let me tell you something folks my flight was delayed all 
day going to new york but i didn't connect with the woman the coach her name is zoe i 
didn't connect with zoe until 430 in the afternoon and guess what happened after i 
connected with her the flight stopped being delayed and i went to new york yes vader 
that is exactly where you're supposed to be okay but i'm here to tell you right relax relax 
okay because if you try to go one minute one mile faster one moment faster than you are 
supposed to right nakisha hicks i know you know i'm stepping on your toe Okay, right 
because we were just talking about this last week I am telling you that sometimes the 
delay is by design You are exactly where you're supposed to be. I sat in that airport all 
day and The minute I had that conversation with Zoe we were together for an hour and a 
half We walked back around the corner and the and the gate agent said who are you 
and I gave her my name She said oh, here's your seat assignment The flight is boarded 
and I got right on that plane and went to New York But I had to wait all day because I 
didn't meet the woman in the morning I didn't meet her as all the other flights were rolling 
over.  

I didn't meet her until the afternoon and I needed to have that conversation with 
her because the minute we got done chopping it up and I had spoke this manifestation of 
my show and she had told me what she was doing and she had said, you know I think I 
can help you and I think that you should help me and we'd it wasn't until that exchange 
happened That I got on the plane Thank you. Keith, I see. We will talk about that, Keith, 
when I talk to you, okay? I'm just saying to you, just know that the delay is by design, 
okay? And I wanna make sure you understand what that looks like, okay? And I promise 
you that you are exactly where you're supposed to be. So whether you are eating Girl 
Scout cookies sitting at your desk, whether you were on a flight back from London, 
whether you are listening to this stream as a lurker, as someone who is active in the 
chat, okay?  

It will align then it is supposed to. Psalmist, exactly what you said. You've been 
talking about your dreams, and then you have to get where you need to be, which is why 
you have to keep talking to them, right? Say, I talk about Caloch all the time, right? 
Caloch tells me all the time, stuff started taking off, Kim Blue, when I started talking to 
you. And I was like, sometimes you have to have the right catalyst. I'm talking to Keisha 
Hicks about some stuff she's got in the hopper. And when that stuff starts to pop off, it's 
gonna be massive, right? But you also have to be in a place where you'd make the 
decision. How many of you know what it is that you wanna do, but you haven't said yes 
to the thing that you want to do? You have to say yes to it. You can't just talk about it. 
You actually have to say, yes, I want to do it.  

Yes, I'm ready for the journey. Yes, I'm willing to step out of this space that I'm in 
and go into the work that needs, I'm ready to go down this tunnel, right? You have to be 
able to say yes. Otherwise, you will remain right where you are. And maybe the right 



 
 

 
 

 

where you are is where you're supposed to be, but you won't move forward until you say 
your yes, until you have accepted whatever this journey is gonna be. So what are you 
not saying yes to that you should be? What decisions do you need to make? Are you 
clear on who's responsible, what you need to be accepted? accountable for, right? And 
are you okay understanding and accepting that sometimes the delay is by design?  

Those are your June Kim gyms for today, right? We will come back with new 
gyms on Thursday, but those are your gyms for today, all right? Okay, thank you all for 
being here, right? Good talk emotes in the chat if you were able to take something away. 
Shout out to everybody who is new that came in to our first time chatters, to those who 
were lurking behind the scenes. Reason, thank you again for the raid, right? We should 
write that down, okay? Catalyst and accelerants. And that's what this journey is about, 
okay? Sitegiver says, cut it off Kim Blue, we gotta end it. We'll pick it up on Thursday, 
right? We'll pick it up on Thursday. Platinum Crew, welcome, and good to see you.  

I think I saw you come in and then I was rolling with what I was talking about and 
I didn't get to say hello. So good talk emotes in the chat. Thank you all for being here. 
Listen, folks, I want everybody to be on there. I am where I'm supposed to be energy. 
Okay making decisions energy here is the book bet on you because you are worth it 
every single day Okay Stop taking the scenic route if it is a distraction a form of 
avoidance or if it is keeping you From doing the thing which is jumping down the tunnel 
and betting on yourself. All right And understand that sometimes the delay is by design 
so get somewhere and sit down and with that Ladies and gentlemen, we are gonna be 
we are gonna be on our way out of here You all know how I feel about you and this 
space.  

Thank you for investing in yourself Thank you for being intentional about Um you 
right exactly exactly rebel, please please get somewhere. Okay And indomitable spirit 
mg says with that I have no edges big stove will tell you I don't intend to snatch edges 
Melissa, but sometimes it happens. Okay sage. You're more than welcome. You are 
more than welcome platinum crew Thank you for making it in. Okay reason. Thank you 
again for the raid. Thank you to everybody Who Made it. I love you mean it big stove 
Okay, listen, we're gonna go see club fro because y 'all remember the last time we were 
supposed to go see fro On soul train.  

He had some issues and we ended up going to support classics, which was fine 
thank goodness for classics, but we are gonna go see club fro because um The time we 
were supposed to raid him. He was having technical issues And so we're gonna make 
that up because fro is the homie and I want to make sure that we go show him some 
love. Okay, so Copy the raid message. Listen folks. I give you this exit monitor all the 
time, right? I tell you That I want to send you into the day with All of the good energy and 
light you need to guide you that good energy is all of the chat, all of the gems, any of the 
information that you took away from this, okay?  



 
 

 
 

 

Let it be the thing that like infuses you and let it be the thing that sits in your 
brain, right? And I know things happen to right now, site giver is tagging me in all of her 
notes and I love you for this sis, I appreciate it. She just is dropping Kim Jim's in her 
Instagram notes. Yesterday she said, don't let humility be your liability at true Bluetooth, 
right, and she just dropped it in there. So find that good energy and let it resonate with 
you and let that be the light that guides you every single day, right, and go get you 
around some people who you can share this light with. That's not me, that's Big Stove, 
right? Give credit where credit is due. If you are not around those people, go find them. 
Go find your blueprint buddy. Go find whoever it is that energizes you that you can share 
that space with safely, okay?  

All of those things are there for you, okay? Take exceptional care of yourselves. 
Good morning, LB. Good to see you. Thank you so much for the re -up. I've been 
rocking with you for the last 18 months. I appreciate you as always, all right? I love you 
guys. Copy the raid message. We are on our way to go see Fro. I will see you on the 
other side and I'll see you again on Thursday. Thank you for being here.  

 


